Joliet Junior College

Bid for Nursing Program Equipment

5/25/2016
Products Unlimited Medical Shipment 4MD Medical Solutions HBR Healthcare Co. Moore Medical Armstrong Medical Laerdal Medical Corp
ITEM QTY _ DESCRIPTION UNIT COST TOTAL COST JUNIT COST TOTAL COST JUNIT COST TOTAL COST JUNIT COST TOTAL COST JUNIT COST TOTAL COST JUNIT COST TOTAL COST JUNIT COST TOTAL COST
STRYKER 721 HYDRAULIC STRETCHER,
1 3 ASSISTED BACK REST, INCLUDING
MATTRESS
$1,795.00|  $5,385.00] $1,999.00| $5,997.00] $2,116.00  $6,348.00|No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Model 1001 (Newer Model) 721 721
Manufacturer]  Refurbished Stryker Refurbished Stryker Refurbished Stryker
Warranty| 1 Year 1Year 1 Year Parts & Labor
2 1 ALARIS MEDLEY 8000 IV PUMP PCU,
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
$530.00 $530.00| $450.00 $450.00} $747.50 $747.50|No Bid $754.75 $754.75|No Bid No Bid
New or Refurbished Refurbished Refurbished Refurbished Refurbished
Model 8000 8000 8000 $8,000.00
er Alaris (C: ion) Alaris Alaris Alaris
Warranty| 1Year 1 Year 1Year 6 Months
3 1 ALARIS 8110 SYRINGE MODULE, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS
$1,668.00|  $1,668.00]  $950.00 $950.00] $1,493.85|  $1,493.85]No Bid $2,138.50|  $2,138.50|No Bid No Bid
New or Refurbished Refurbished Refurbished Refurbished Refurbished
Model 8110 8110 8110 8110
er Alaris (C: ion) Alaris Alaris Alaris
Warranty| 1Year 1 Year 1Year 6 Months
4 1 ELECTRIC EASY LIFT, PATIENT LIFTING
SYSTEM
$1,329.00  $1,329.00] $2,620.00| $2,620.00] $1,996.80|  $1,996.80| No Bid $1,012.75|  $1,012.75|No Bid No Bid
Model LF1050 LF2020 (Sling is Extra) LF1050 P-C-HLA-2
Manufacturer| Graham Field Lumex-Graham Field Graham Field Hoyer
Frame & Spreader Bar 3
Warranty| 1Year Year limited 1Year
SEYMOUR Il DECUBITUS WOUND
5 4 CARE MODEL VT0910; LIGHTLY
PIGMENTED
$542.00  $2,168.00]  $599.00|  $2,396.00|No Bid No Bid $645.80|  $2,583.20]  $473.44|  $1,893.76]No Bid
SEYMOUR Il DECUBITUS WOUND
6 4 CARE MODEL VT0920; DARKLY
PIGMENTED
$542.00 $2,168.00| No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $473.44 $1,893.76No Bid
NEW LAERDAL SIMMAN ESSENTIAL
7 1 MANIKIN AND ACCESSORIES
PRODUCT NUMBER 213-02001, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $45,914.78
Model 213-02001
Manufacturer| Laerdal
Warranty 1 Yr Manuf. Warranty
LAPTOP
Model Dell
Manufacturer| LLEAP Monitor E5440
Warranty| 3 Years
ALL IN ONE PCINSTRUCTOR - PATIENT MONITOR
Model All-in-One Aio HP 23"
Manufacturer| HP
Warranty)| 3 Years
VICTORIA MEDIUM TONE ADVANCED
BIRTHING SIMULATOR WITH
NEWBORN TORY MEDIUM SKIN TONE
g 1 ADVANCED 40 WEEK SIMULATOR,
VIRTUAL MONITOR SOFTWARE
LICENSE, AND AUTOMATIC
PHYSIOLOGIC CONTROL, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 1 REFURBISHED ADJUSTABLE HOSPITAL
BED
$1,835.00f  $1,835.00] $1,999.00 $1,999.00) $1,753.75 $1,753.75] $1,465.00 $1,465.00] $2,375.00 $2,375.00| No Bid No Bid
Model Advanta Advance Advance w/Mattress 1135 Advance Series H-1105
Manufacturer| Hill Rom Hill Rom Hill Rom Hill-Rom Hill-Rom
Warranty| 1 Year 1 Year 1 Year 2 Years 6 Months
10 8 SIMLEGGINGS, ADULT LARGE, BEIGE
COLOR, PAIR
$317.00 $2,536.00) $345.60 $2,764.80] No Bid No Bid $455.00 $3,640.00] No Bi No Bid
TOTAL] $17,619.00 $17,176.80 $12,339.90 $1,465.00 $12,504.20 $3,787.52 $45,914.78
CERTIFICATION OF CONTRACT BIDDER| Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Notesl Shipping & Handling Add Net 30 Days
$850.00
No Bid:
Nasco

Daigger Scientific



